
 

Attorney Training 
 
 

Private Attorneys and Public Defenders can access the public user’s website for Smart 
Communications at www.smartinmate.com Users can create accounts and select inmates 
from any of the Smart Communications facilities. Users can choose to connect with Inmates 
for sending messages, uploading legal mail, and video visitation. Note that not all services 
are available at every agency. 

At a minimum, agencies require privileged users upload a copy of their State ID or Drivers 
License and a copy of their Bar Card. Privileged users must be approved by the agency before 
the use of any of the services. Once the agency approves your account, you will receive an 
email advising you are approved. Messages, Legal Mail, Video Visitation, and uploaded 
documents between inmates and privileged users are not visible to the agency or Smart 
Communications. 

 
 

Access the Smart Communications website at www.smartinmate.com 

Start the sign-up process as shown below. 

 



All Public users including privileged users must complete the enrollment process. The 
process includes creating a username and password as well as entering personal 
information including a cell phone number. The number is used for verification purposes. 
You will receive a text with a code used to authenticate your account. 

 

Once the account is created, users can search for inmates at any of the Smart 
Communications facilities. 

 



Users can search for Inmates based on ID Number, Last Name, First Name, Date of Birth or 
a combination of any of the fields. It is not necessary to enter every field to get returns. 

 



Users will be asked to select their relationship to the Inmate. Be sure to select the 
applicable choice of Private Attorney or Public Defender. 

 

The first time you select a facility, inmate, and your relationship to the inmate, you will be 
directed to the below page to upload required documentation. 

 



Attorneys can upload legal documents from the website. Users can require signatures on 
the documents if applicable. This will allow the inmate to sign the document on his 
assigned tablet and return to you. 

 

 

 

 
Messages can be sent to Inmates. In most cases the system is configured not to allow 
Inmates to send messages to Attorneys or respond back from messages sent. This is based 
on global setting at the agency. 

 

 

 
If you any questions please contact Smart Communications Customer Support, an 
Administrator at the Facility, or the Facility’s Smart Communications Client Services 
Representative Don Newsome don.newsome@smartcommunications.us 


